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Touch and Go is a title that I chose together with 
Irini Papadimitriou for this lea special issue. On my 
part with this title I wanted to stress several aspects 
that characterize that branch of contemporary art in 
love with interaction, be it delivered by allowing the 
audience to touch the art object or by becoming part 
of a complex electronic sensory experience in which 
the artwork may somehow respond and touch back 
in return. 

With the above statement, I wanted to deliberately 
avoid the terminology ‘interactive art’ in order to not 
fall in the trap of characterizing art that has an ele-
ment of interaction as principally defined by the word 
interactive; as if this were the only way to describe 
contemporary art that elicits interactions and re-
sponses between the artist, the audience and the art 
objects. 

I remember when I was at Central Saint Martins 
writing a paper on the sub-distinctions within con-
temporary media arts and tracing the debates that 
distinguished between electronic art, robotic art, new 
media art, digital art, computer art, computer based 
art, internet art, web art… At some point of that analy-
sis and argument I realized that the common thread 
that characterized all of these sub-genres of aesthetic 
representations was the word art and it did not matter 
(at least not that much in my opinion) if the manifesta-
tion was material or immaterial, conceptual or physical, 
electronic or painterly, analogue or digital.

I increasingly felt that this rejection of the technical 
component would be necessary in order for the elec-
tronic-robotic-new-media-digital-computer-based-
internet art object to re-gain entry within the field of 
fine art. Mine was a reaction to an hyper-fragmented 

and indeed extensive and in-depth taxonomy that 
seemed to have as its main effect that of pushing 
these experimental and innovative art forms – through 
the emphasis of their technological characterization – 
away from the fine arts and into a ghetto of isolation 
and self-reference. Steve Dietz’s question – Why Have 
There Been No Great Net Artists? 1 – remains unan-
swered, but I believe that there are changes that are 
happening – albeit slowly – that will see the sensorial 
and technical elements become important parts of 
the aesthetic aspects of the art object as much as the 
brush technique of Vincent Willem van Gogh or the 
sculptural fluidity of Henry Moore. 

Hence the substitution in the title of this special issue 
of the word interactivity with the word touch, with the 
desire of looking at the artwork as something that can 
be touched in material and immaterial ways, interfered 
with, interacted with and ‘touched and reprocessed’ 
with the help of media tools but that can also ‘touch’ 
us back in return, both individually and collectively. I 
also wanted to stress the fast interrelation between 
the art object and the consumer in a commodified 
relationship that is based on immediate engagement 
and fast disengagement, touch and go. But a fast food 
approach is perhaps incorrect if we consider as part of 
the interactivity equation the viewers’ mediated pro-
cesses of consumption and memorization of both the 
image and the public experience.

Nevertheless, the problems and issues that interactiv-
ity and its multiple definitions and interpretations in 
the 20th and 21st century raise cannot be overlooked, 
as much as cannot be dismissed the complex set of 
emotive and digital interactions that can be set in mo-
tion by artworks that reach and engage large groups 
of people within the public space. These interactions 

generate public shows in which the space of the city 
becomes the background to an experiential event that 
is characterized by impermanence and memorization. 
It is a process in which thousands of people engage, 
capture data, memorize and at times memorialize the 
event and re-process, mash-up, re-disseminate and 
re-contextualize the images within multiple media 
contexts. 

The possibility of capturing, viewing and understand-
ing the entire mass of data produced by these aes-
thetic sensory experiences becomes an impossible 
task due to easy access to an unprecedented amount 
of media and an unprecedented multiplication of data, 
as Lev Manovich argues. 2
In Digital Baroque: New Media Art and Cinematic 
Folds Timothy Murray writes that “the retrospective 
nature of repetition and digital coding—how initial im-
ages, forms, and narratives are refigured through their 
contemplative re-citation and re-presentation—con-
sistently inscribes the new media in the memory and 
memorization of its antecedents, cinema and video.” 3
The difference between memorization and memori-
alization may be one of the further aspects in which 
the interaction evolves – beyond the artwork but still 
linked to it. The memory of the event with its happen-
ing and performative elements, its traces and records 
both official and unofficial, the re-processing and 
mash-ups; all of these elements become part of and 
contribute to a collective narrative and pattern of en-
gagement and interaction. 

These are issues and problems that the artists and 
writers of this lea special issue have analyzed from a 
variety of perspectives and backgrounds, offering to 
the reader the opportunity of a glimpse into the com-
plexity of today’s art interactions within the contem-
porary social and cultural media landscapes.

Touch and Go is one of those issues that are truly 
born from a collaborative effort and in which all edi-
tors have contributed and worked hard in order to 

deliver a documentation of contemporary art research, 
thought and aesthetic able to stand on the interna-
tional scene. 

For this reason I wish to thank Prof. Janis Jefferies 
and Irini Papadimitriou together with Jonathan Munro 
and Özden Şahin for their efforts. The design is by 
Deniz Cem Önduygu who as lea’s Art Director contin-
ues to deliver brilliantly designed issues. 

Lanfranco Aceti 
Editor in Chief, Leonardo Electronic Almanac
Director, Kasa Gallery

Watermans International 
Festival of Digital Art, 2012

E D I T O R I A LE D I T O R I A L

1. “Nevertheless, there is this constant apparently inherent 

need to try and categorize and classify. In Beyond Inter-

face, an exhibition I organized in 1998, I ‘datamined’ ten 

categories: net.art, storytelling, socio-cultural, biographical, 

tools, performance, analog-hybrid, interactive art, interfac-

ers + artificers. David Ross, in his lecture here at the CAD-

RE Laboratory for New Media, suggested 21 characteris-

tics of net art. Stephen Wilson, a pioneering practitioner, 

has a virtual – albeit well-ordered – jungle of categories. 

Rhizome has developed a list of dozens of keyword 

categories for its ArtBase. Lev Manovich, in his Computing 

Culture: Defining New Media Genres symposium focused 

on the categories of database, interface, spatialization, 

and navigation. To my mind, there is no question that such 

categorization is useful, especially in a distributed system 

like the Internet. But, in truth, to paraphrase Barnett New-

man, “ornithology is for the birds what categorization is 

for the artist.” Perhaps especially at a time of rapid change 

and explosive growth of the underlying infrastructure and 

toolsets, it is critical that description follow practice and 

not vice versa.” Steve Dietz, Why Have There Been No 

Great Net Artists? Web Walker Daily 28, April 4, 2000,

http://bit.ly/QjEWlY (accessed July 1, 2012). 

2. This link to a Google+ conversation is an example of this 

argument on massive data and multiple media engage-

ments across diverse platforms: http://bit.ly/pGgDsS 

(accessed July 1, 2012). 

3. Timothy Murray, Digital Baroque: New Media Art and 

Cinematic Folds (Minneapolis: University of Minnesota 

Press, 2008), 138.
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